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Rules of Procedure of the Organization for Security 
and Co-operation in Europe 
 
I. Participation in the OSCE 
 
1. All States participating in the OSCE shall do so as sovereign and inde-
pendent States and in conditions of full equality. 
 

2. Each of the participating States shall decide on its representation in OSCE 
bodies and at OSCE meetings. 
 
 
II. OSCE Decision-Making and Informal Bodies 
 
(A) General provisions 
 
1. The participating States of the OSCE may establish and dissolve working 
bodies of the OSCE which are authorized to take decisions and adopt docu-
ments having a politically binding character for all the participating States or 
reflecting the agreed views of all the participating States, hereinafter referred 
to as OSCE decision-making bodies. Only such bodies shall be regarded as 
official/formal OSCE bodies. Other bodies shall be regarded as informal bod-
ies. 
 

2. Decisions of the OSCE decision-making bodies shall be adopted by con-
sensus. Consensus shall be understood to mean the absence of any objection 
expressed by a participating State to the adoption of the decision in question. 
This paragraph shall apply without prejudice to the earlier adopted CSCE/ 
OSCE documents referred to in Annex 2. 
 

3. Any texts, which have been adopted by a decision-making body by con-
sensus, such as decisions, statements, declarations, reports, letters or other 
documents, shall hereinafter be referred to as OSCE decisions or OSCE 
documents. Such documents shall have a politically binding character for all 
the participating States or reflect the agreed views of all the participating 
States. 
 

4. Documents issued by the Chairpersons of OSCE decision-making bodies 
or by OSCE executive structures shall not be regarded as OSCE documents 
and their texts shall not require approval by all the participating States. 
 

5. Each decision-making body may set up subordinate decision-making bod-
ies or dissolve them. In the former case, the participating States shall clearly 
define the terms of reference or mandate of these bodies and may amend 
them whenever appropriate. In the latter case, the tasks of a dissolved 
decision-making body may be transferred to other decision-making bodies. 
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6. Each decision-making body may set up informal subsidiary working bod-
ies, hereinafter referred to as informal subsidiary bodies (ISBs), or dissolve 
them. These ISBs shall not have a decision-making capacity as specified in 
paragraph II(A)1 and shall be open to all participating States. 
 

7. Each ISB shall work in accordance with its terms of reference or mandate 
and shall be accountable and report to a decision-making body hereinafter 
referred to as the superior decision-making body of that ISB. 
 

8. The decision-making bodies, the Chairpersons of decision-making bodies, 
and the Chairpersons of ISBs in close consultation with their superior 
decision-making body, may set up or dissolve ad hoc/thematic open-ended 
informal working bodies, hereinafter referred to as informal working groups 
(IWGs), which shall not have a decision-making capacity as specified in 
paragraph II(A)1 and which shall be open to all the participating States. 
 

9. Each IWG shall work in accordance with its terms of reference or mandate 
and shall be accountable and report to a decision-making body, the Chairper-
son of a decision-making body or the Chairperson of an ISB, hereinafter re-
ferred to as the superior authority of that IWG. 
 

10. When setting up an ISB or IWG, the establishing authority shall clearly 
define the terms of reference for that body and it may amend them whenever 
appropriate. When an ISB or an IWG is dissolved, the tasks of the dissolved 
body may be transferred to other ISBs or IWGs. 
 

11. A conference, seminar, workshop or other meeting which is held by a de-
cision of the participating States shall be referred to hereinafter as an OSCE 
meeting. The participating States may decide to hold regular OSCE meetings, 
ad hoc OSCE meetings, or joint OSCE meetings with other international or-
ganizations or States. 
 

12. The participating States shall be represented in the decision-making bod-
ies, ISBs, IWGs and OSCE meetings by such delegates and experts, herein-
after referred to as Representatives, as they shall designate for the purpose. 
 

13. The decision-making bodies may establish or dissolve, in keeping with 
their respective levels of authority, specific structures for the implementation 
of decisions taken and tasks set by the participating States. Such structures 
include the Secretariat, institutions, field operations, special representatives 
or other operational instruments of the Organization, hereinafter referred to as 
executive structures of the OSCE. When establishing an executive structure, 
the establishing authority shall clearly define its mandate and it may amend 
that mandate whenever appropriate. The decision-making body, which cre-
ated the executive structure, shall constitute its superior authority. 
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14. Unless otherwise decided by the participating States, 
 

- Algeria, Egypt, Israel, Jordan, Morocco and Tunisia shall hereinafter be 
referred to as Mediterranean Partners for Co-operation; 

- Afghanistan, Japan, Mongolia, the Republic of Korea and Thailand 
shall hereinafter be referred to as Asian Partners for Co-operation; 

- Asian and Mediterranean Partners for Co-operation may also be referred 
to as Partners for Co-operation; 

- The modalities for the participation of the Partners for Co-operation in 
the work of the OSCE decision-making and informal bodies and OSCE 
meetings shall be governed by the relevant chapters of this document. 

 
(B) Structure of the OSCE decision-making bodies 
 
1. Unless otherwise decided by the participating States, the OSCE shall 
maintain the following structure of decision-making bodies. 
 

2. The highest OSCE decision-making body is the Meeting of Heads of State 
or Government (Summit), which takes decisions, sets priorities and provides 
orientation at the highest political level. 
 

3. The Ministerial Council, consisting of the ministers for foreign affairs of 
the participating States, is the central decision-making and governing body of 
the OSCE between Summits. It is the central forum for political consultations 
within the OSCE and may consider and take decisions on any issue relevant 
to the Organization. The Ministerial Council shall implement tasks defined 
and decisions taken by the Meetings of Heads of State or Government. The 
participating States may decide to convene regular or ad hoc meetings of 
other ministers with decision-making capacity as specified in paragraphs 
II(A)1 and II(A)5. 
 

4. The Permanent Council (PC) is the principal decision-making body for 
regular political consultations and for governing the day-to-day operational 
work of the Organization between meetings of the Ministerial Council. It 
shall implement, within its area of competence, tasks defined and decisions 
taken by the Meetings of Heads of State or Government and the Ministerial 
Council. 
 

5. The PC may convene reinforced PC meetings at the level of political di-
rectors or other senior officials from capitals in order to consider issues re-
quiring such a level of representation and to adopt decisions. 
 

6. The PC may also convene special PC meetings in order to discuss matters 
of non-compliance with OSCE commitments and to decide on appropriate 
courses of action. Special PC meetings may also be convened for other pur-
poses in the periods when regular PC meetings are not normally held or for 
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the consideration of a particular issue/topic. Decisions adopted at reinforced 
or special meetings shall have the same force as other decisions of the PC. 
 

7. The Forum for Security Co-operation (FSC) is the autonomous decision-
making body with the mandate set in relevant decisions of the Meetings of 
Heads of State or Government and the Ministerial Council. It shall imple-
ment, within its area of competence, tasks defined and decisions taken by the 
Meetings of Heads of State or Government and the Ministerial Council. 
 

8. The FSC may convene special FSC meetings for the consideration of a 
particular issue/topic or for other purposes in the periods when regular FSC 
meetings are not normally held. Decisions adopted at special meetings shall 
have the same force as other decisions of the FSC. 
 

9. The PC and the FSC may convene joint meetings to consider issues related 
to the competence of both bodies and adopt PC and/or FSC decisions. 
 
(C) Other structures and institutions 
 
1. Unless otherwise decided by the PC or a higher-level decision-making 
body, the PC shall have the following ISBs as specified in paragraph II(A)6: 
the Preparatory Committee (PrepComm) as the highest-level ISB of the PC, 
the Advisory Committee on Management and Finance (ACMF), the Eco-
nomic and Environmental Subcommittee (EESC), the Contact Group with the 
Mediterranean Partners for Co-operation and the Contact Group with the 
Asian Partners for Co-operation. (The latter two bodies may also be referred 
to as Contact Groups with the Partners for Co-operation.) 
 

2. Unless otherwise decided by the FSC or a higher-level decision-making 
body, the FSC shall have the following ISBs, as specified in paragraph 
II(A)6: Working Group A, Working Group B and the OSCE Communica-
tions Group. 
 

3. The Parliamentary Assembly of the OSCE (OSCE PA), as an autonomous 
OSCE body which is composed of members of parliament from the OSCE 
participating States and maintains close relationships with other OSCE 
structures, determines its own rules of procedure and working methods. The 
modalities for the participation of the OSCE PA in the work of the OSCE de-
cision-making and informal bodies and in OSCE meetings are set out in 
chapters IV.1(D), IV.2, V and VI(A) of this document. 
 

4. The OSCE Court of Conciliation and Arbitration, as the body established 
for settlement, by means of conciliation and, where appropriate, arbitration, 
of disputes which are submitted to it in accordance with the provisions of the 
Convention on Conciliation and Arbitration within the CSCE (Stockholm, 
1992), determines its own rules, subject to approval by States parties to that 
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Convention. The OSCE rules of procedure, as set out in this document, shall 
not apply to the Court of Conciliation and Arbitration. 
 
 
III. Chairmanship and Troika 
 
1. The OSCE Chairmanship-in-Office, hereinafter referred to as the Chair-
manship, shall be held for one calendar year by the participating State desig-
nated as such by a decision of the Summit or the Ministerial Council, as a 
rule two years before the Chairmanship’s term of office starts. 
 

2. The Chairmanship shall be responsible on behalf of the Ministerial Council 
and the PC for co-ordination of and consultation on current OSCE business. 
The functions of the Chairmanship shall be exercised by the minister for for-
eign affairs (hereinafter referred to as Chairman-in-Office) of that participat-
ing State together with his/her staff, including the Chairperson of the PC. 
 

3. In performing its duties, the Chairmanship shall act in accordance with 
OSCE decisions, and shall be assisted by the preceding and succeeding 
Chairmanships, operating together as a Troika. The Chairmanship shall be 
supported by the executive structures of the OSCE. 
 

4. The FSC Chairmanship shall be held for the period from the end of each 
recess (winter, spring, summer) to the end of the following recess by the par-
ticipating States, succeeding each other in the French alphabetical order. The 
FSC Chairmanship shall be responsible on behalf of the FSC for co-
ordination of and consultation on current FSC business. 
 

5. In performing its duties, the FSC Chairmanship shall act in accordance 
with OSCE decisions, and shall be assisted by the preceding and succeeding 
FSC Chairmanships, operating together as an FSC Troika. The FSC Chair-
manship shall be supported by the relevant executive structures of the OSCE. 
Should a participating State waive its turn to chair the FSC, it will have the 
option of participating in the FSC Troika as an additional member during the 
period in which it was due to exercise the chairmanship. 
 
 
IV. Rules of Procedure for Decision-Making Bodies 
 
IV.1 General Rules 
 
(A) Procedural aspects of decision-making 
 
1. Proposals for draft decisions may be initiated by the Chairmanship or FSC 
Chairmanship, as appropriate, or by any participating State or group of par-
ticipating States. Proposals of participating States or groups of participating 
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States shall be submitted in writing to the Chairperson of the relevant 
decision-making body and circulated as soon as possible to all participating 
States.  
 

2. The Chairperson shall ensure that draft decisions are considered in an ap-
propriate IWG, ISB and/or subordinate decision-making body of the decision-
making body to which the draft decision has been submitted, or otherwise 
discussed by all the participating States prior to the submission of the draft 
decision for adoption.  
 

3. The Chairperson shall submit the draft decision for adoption by including 
it in the draft agenda of an appropriate meeting if it has been forwarded to 
him/her by a subordinate decision-making body or ISB. The Chairperson 
may also submit draft decisions for adoption on his/her own initiative if the 
conditions set out in paragraph IV.1(A)2 are met.  
 

4. The absence of a Representative at a meeting of a decision-making body 
shall not be considered as an objection of that participating State or constitute 
an obstacle to the adoption of decisions at that meeting. 
 

5. Decisions shall be adopted at meetings of decision-making bodies or, if so 
determined by consensus, through the application of a silence procedure. The 
modalities for the application of a silence procedure by the Ministerial Coun-
cil, the PC and the FSC are set out in Annex 1. 
 

6. Representatives may ask for their formal reservations or interpretative 
statements concerning given decisions, including those through a silence pro-
cedure, to be duly registered by the Secretariat and circulated to the partici-
pating States. Such formal reservations and interpretative statements must be 
submitted in writing to the Secretariat.2 
 

7. Each decision shall enter into force on the date of its adoption unless 
otherwise specified in the text of the decision. If a decision has been adopted 
through a silence procedure, the date of the expiration of the period of silence 
shall be regarded as the date of adoption of the decision. 
 

8. Once adopted, decisions shall not require an additional endorsement or ap-
proval by a higher-level decision-making body. Draft decisions requiring 
adoption by a higher-level decision-making body shall be forwarded, without 
adoption, to that decision-making body. 
 

9. Any decision may be amended or overruled by the same decision-making 
body that has adopted the decision, unless this decision-making body speci-
fies that a lower-level decision-making body may amend or overrule it. Any 

                                                           
2  This paragraph is intended to codify past and existing CSCE/OSCE practice with regard 

to formal reservations and interpretative statements.  
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decision may be amended or overruled by a higher-level decision-making 
body. 
 

10. Texts of documents for adoption jointly by the OSCE participating States 
and other parties, including international organizations, shall be adopted by a 
decision of a relevant OSCE decision-making body. Such a decision shall 
contain provisions ensuring that a joint document with other parties comes 
into effect for the OSCE upon that document’s entry into force for the other 
parties or for the OSCE, whichever is the later. 
 
(B) Working languages and official records 
 
1. The working languages of the OSCE shall be: English, French, German, 
Italian, Russian and Spanish. 
 

2. Meetings of the decision-making bodies shall be conducted with interpret-
ation between the working languages. Exceptionally, the Chairperson of a 
decision-making body may suggest, giving a clear explanation of the reasons, 
that, with the consent of the participating States, a meeting or a part of a 
meeting should be held in one language only, without interpretation. 
 

3. Any Representative may make a statement in a language other than the 
working languages. In this case, he/she shall himself/herself provide for in-
terpretation into one of the working languages. 
 

4. Proceedings of the meetings of decision-making bodies shall be recorded 
in the journals of meetings, which shall constitute the only official OSCE rec-
ords. These shall be issued both on paper and in electronic format in all the 
working languages, and shall be made public. 
 

5. The journals shall be in a standard OSCE format and shall contain the fol-
lowing information about a meeting: the date(s), the time of opening/suspen-
sion/resumption/closing, name(s) of the Chairperson(s), subjects discussed, 
lists of statements made under each agenda item and sub-item (with reference 
numbers of statements distributed), records of decisions adopted, as well as 
the date, time and place of the next meeting. 
 

6. The texts of decisions, with interpretative statements and formal reserva-
tions attached, if any, shall be circulated to the participating States in all the 
working languages in a standard OSCE format, shall be appended to the 
journal of the meeting at which the decision has been adopted and shall be 
made public. The texts of decisions adopted by a decision-making body 
through a silence procedure shall be appended to the journal of the first 
meeting of that body following the expiration of the silence period. 
 

7. Statements made at a meeting may be annexed to the journal of the meet-
ing if so requested by a Representative at the meeting and agreed by the 
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Chairperson. Such documents shall be submitted in writing to the Secretariat. 
The Chairperson may, if necessary, annex to the journal other documents 
relevant to that particular meeting, including Chairperson’s statements, after 
announcing that at the meeting. 
 

8. The journals shall be issued by the Secretariat as soon as possible, upon 
approval of their contents by the Chairperson(s) of the meeting in question. 
 

9. Language conforming of the translations of documents adopted by the 
Ministerial Council and Meetings of Heads of State or Government shall be 
organized by the respective Chairmanship, following the distribution in all 
the working languages of the journal(s) of the respective meeting(s). Origin-
ally adopted texts of those documents or texts of documents not falling within 
the meaning of paragraph II(A)3 shall not be subject to language conforming. 
 

10. The final document of each Ministerial Council meeting or Meeting of 
Heads of State or Government shall be compiled in a standard OSCE format 
as a separate volume, the contents and structure of which shall be defined by 
the respective Chairmanship with the assistance of the Secretariat. The final 
document shall contain the texts of all the documents adopted at the meeting, 
the texts of other documents annexed to its journal(s) and the texts of selected 
reports and letters submitted to that meeting. The final document shall be 
printed and issued in an electronic format in all the working languages. 
 

11. All statements made at meetings of decision-making bodies in working 
languages other than English and subsequently distributed to all the partici-
pating States in a written form shall be translated by the Secretariat into Eng-
lish. 
 
(C) Conduct of meetings 
 
1. Any meeting of a decision-making body shall be conducted in accordance 
with an agenda. Decision-making bodies shall keep standing items on the 
agenda of their meetings: “review of current issues”, “general statements”, or 
“security dialogue” (as appropriate to the purview of the decision-making 
body), and “any other business”, under which any issue may be raised by any 
participating State. Titles of documents to be adopted at a meeting of the PC 
or FSC shall be included in the draft agenda as separate items or sub-items, 
pursuant to paragraph IV.1(A)3. 
 

2. Draft agendas for Summits and Ministerial Council meetings shall be pre-
pared and issued by the Chairmanship and forwarded to the Chairperson of 
the Summit or the Ministerial Council meeting by a PC decision. The agenda 
shall be formally adopted at the beginning of the meeting and appended to 
the journal of that meeting. 
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3. Draft agendas of the meetings of the PC shall be prepared and issued in 
advance by the Chairmanship, taking into account views expressed by par-
ticipating States. The Chairperson shall announce the agenda at the beginning 
of the meeting. If a reservation is expressed by a participating State regarding 
a non-standing item of the draft agenda, the Chairperson shall decide on the 
agenda of that meeting as appropriate. 
 

4. Draft agendas of the FSC shall be prepared by the FSC Chairmanship and 
discussed in the FSC Troika. The draft agendas shall thereafter be issued and 
agreed upon by the FSC at the beginning of each meeting. 
 

5. The Chairperson shall ensure the good order and smooth running of meet-
ings. 
 

6. During the meetings, the Chairperson shall keep a list of speakers to which 
all Representatives shall have equal and unhindered access. 
 

7. During the meetings, the Chairperson may declare the list of speakers 
closed with the consent of the meeting. If a statement made after the closure 
of the list of speakers makes desirable a reply by a Representative, the Chair-
person shall accord the right of reply to that Representative, at his/her re-
quest. 
 

8. If a Representative wishes to raise a point of order, he/she shall communi-
cate that wish to the Chairperson, and the latter shall give him/her the floor 
immediately. A Representative raising a point of order may not speak on the 
substance of the matter under discussion. 
 

9. The Chairperson may change the order of consideration of agenda items 
with the consent of the meeting. He/she may suspend and resume the meeting 
as he/she deems necessary. 
 

10. At the meetings of the decision-making bodies each participating State 
shall have one seat at the main table with a nameplate. 
 

11. At the meetings of the decision-making bodies, the European Commis-
sion shall have one seat next to the participating State holding the EU Presi-
dency. 
 
(D) Other participants 
 
1. Representatives of the OSCE PA and of executive structures may attend 
meetings of the decision-making bodies. They may make oral contributions 
at the invitation of the Chairperson of a meeting under an item on the agenda. 
They shall not participate in the drafting of documents, but may comment on 
drafts that directly concern them, at the invitation of the Chairperson. 
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2. The Partners for Co-operation and international organizations, institutions 
and initiatives may be invited by the participating States, on a regular or case-
by-case basis, to attend meetings of decision-making bodies and make oral 
and/or written contributions, without the right to participate in the drafting of 
documents. Unless otherwise agreed by the participating States, the specific 
modalities for their participation at meetings of decision-making bodies, as 
set out in this chapter and chapter IV.2 below, shall apply. 
 

3. Japan may attend and make both oral and written contributions at meetings 
of the decision-making bodies, without the right to participate in the drafting 
of documents. 
 

4. Other Partners for Co-operation may attend and make both oral and written 
contributions at the Meetings of Heads of State or Government and Minister-
ial Council meetings and, upon invitation by the respective Chairperson, at 
certain meetings of the PC and the FSC, without the right to participate in the 
drafting of documents. 
 

5. Representatives of other international organizations, institutions and initia-
tives, as well as non-governmental organizations (NGOs), academia and 
business may be invited by the participating States, on a case-by-case basis, 
to attend certain meetings of decision-making bodies and make oral and/or 
written contributions. 
 

6. The participating States may decide to make certain meetings or sessions 
during meetings of decision-making bodies open to NGOs, the press and the 
public. 
 
IV.2 Specific Rules 
 
(A) Meetings of Heads of State or Government 
 
1. The time and venue of Meetings of Heads of State or Government shall be 
determined by the Ministerial Council or the PC. A Meeting of Heads of 
State or Government or the Ministerial Council may decide on the frequency 
of Summits. 
 

2. The decision on the timetable and organizational modalities for each 
Meeting of Heads of State or Government shall be adopted by the PC not 
later than two months before the meeting. 
 

3. The Meetings of Heads of State or Government shall have a duration of 
not more than two days, as a rule, and shall consist of several plenary ses-
sions, including opening and closing plenary sessions. 
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4. The Chair at the opening and closing sessions shall be taken by the host 
country. The Chair at other plenary sessions shall be taken by the Troika 
countries or those participating States designated by the PC. 
 

5. The Meetings of Heads of State or Government shall be open to the press 
and the public, and the proceedings shall be broadcast live in all the working 
languages to the media centre and NGO centre by closed-circuit television, 
unless otherwise decided by the participating States. 
 

6. For each Meeting of Heads of State or Government, the PC shall specify 
the list of international organizations, institutions and initiatives to be invited 
to attend and to make oral and/or written contributions. 
 

7. The order of statements by the participating States shall be established by 
the drawing of lots. The European Commission may take the floor immedi-
ately after the participating State holding the EU Presidency. 
 

8. The President of the OSCE PA shall be invited to address the Meeting of 
Heads of State or Government at the opening session. 
 

9. The Partners for Co-operation shall be invited to address the Meeting of 
Heads of State or Government after the statements by the participating States 
in the order established by the drawing of lots. 
 

10. Other participants invited to address the Meeting of Heads of State or 
Government pursuant to paragraph 6 above will speak in the order estab-
lished by the PC. 
 

11. Statements at the meetings should not exceed five minutes. 
 
(B) Meetings of the Ministerial Council 
 
1. The time and venue of the Ministerial Council meetings shall be deter-
mined by the Ministerial Council or the PC. The Ministerial Council shall 
meet, as a rule, once a year in the country holding the Chairmanship, unless 
otherwise decided by the participating States. 
 
2. The decision on the timetable and organizational modalities for each Min-
isterial Council meeting shall be adopted by the PC not later than one month 
before the meeting. 
 

3. The meetings shall have a duration of not more than two days and shall 
consist of several plenary sessions, including opening and closing plenary 
sessions. 
 

4. The meetings shall be chaired by the Chairman-in-Office. The Chair at 
plenary sessions, other than opening and closing plenary sessions and those 
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taking up agenda items which are subject to discussion and possible decision, 
may be delegated to the preceding and/or incoming Chairman-in-Office. 
 

5. For each meeting, the PC shall specify the list of international organiza-
tions, institutions and initiatives to be invited to attend and to make oral 
and/or written contributions. 
 

6. Only the opening and closing sessions shall be open to the press and the 
public, unless the meeting decides to make other sessions open. Unless 
otherwise decided, all sessions, except for those taking up agenda items 
which are subject to discussion and possible decision, shall be broadcast live 
in all the working languages to the media centre and NGO centre by closed-
circuit television. 
 

7. The order of statements by the participating States shall be established by 
the drawing of lots. The European Commission may take the floor immedi-
ately after the participating State holding the EU Presidency. 
 

8. The President of the OSCE PA shall be invited to address the meeting at 
the opening session. 
 

9. The Partners for Co-operation shall be invited to address the meeting after 
the statements by the participating States in the order established by the 
drawing of lots. 
 

10. Other participants invited to address the meeting pursuant to paragraph 5 
above will speak in the order established by the PC. 
 

11. Statements at the meetings should not exceed five minutes. 
 
(C) Meetings of the PC and FSC 
 
1. The meetings of these bodies shall take place, as a rule, once a week in Vi-
enna. They may also be held at the venue of the Ministerial Council meetings 
and Meetings of Heads of State or Government, or elsewhere, if so decided 
by the participating States. The PC and FSC meetings shall be convened and 
chaired by the respective Chairperson or his/her representative. 
 
2. The Chairmanship shall determine exact dates for the winter, spring and 
summer recesses during which meetings shall not, as a rule, be held. 
 

3. The Chairperson may invite the States specified in paragraph IV.1(D)4 to 
certain meetings. 
 

4. The Chairperson may invite high-level officials from the participating 
States and other international organizations, institutions and initiatives to ad-
dress a meeting as a guest speaker. 
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5. Unless otherwise decided by the participating States, the meetings shall be 
closed to the press and the public. The Chairperson may allow the presence 
of the press during presentations of guest speakers. He/she may allow the 
presence of a limited number of visitors upon request of a participating State 
or the Secretariat. 
 

6. The order of statements for each agenda item or sub-item shall be estab-
lished by the Chairperson according to the order of requests for the floor. 
Such requests may be communicated to the Chairperson in advance. 
 

7. Statements at the meetings shall not, as a rule, be limited in time. The 
Chairperson may request speakers to limit the length of their interventions if 
there is a time constraint for the duration of a meeting. 
 
(D) Joint meetings of the PC and FSC 
 
1. Joint FSC-PC meetings may be convened by the Chairpersons of both 
bodies when necessary and shall be co-chaired by both of them or their repre-
sentatives. 
 

2. The rules contained in paragraphs IV.2(C)3 to IV.2(C)7 shall apply, muta-
tis mutandis, to joint FSC-PC meetings. 
 

3. PC and/or FSC decisions may be adopted at the joint FSC–PC meetings. 
The journals of the meetings shall be issued as set out in chapter IV.1(B). 
 
 
V. Rules of Procedure for Informal Bodies 
 
(A) Informal subsidiary bodies of the decision-making bodies 
 
1. The work of an ISB shall be co-ordinated by its Chairperson, who shall be 
accountable and report to the Chairperson of the superior decision-making 
body, as set out in paragraph II(A)7. 
 

2. Unless otherwise laid down in the terms of reference of an ISB, the func-
tions of the Chairperson of an ISB shall be exercised by a representative of 
the Chairmanship or the FSC Chairmanship, as appropriate. In cases where 
an ISB is chaired by a representative of another participating State or the Sec-
retariat, the overall responsibility for the work of that ISB shall remain with 
the Chairmanship or the FSC Chairmanship, as appropriate. Unless otherwise 
decided by the participating States, the latter provision shall relate to the fol-
lowing ISBs: 
 

(a) The ACMF, during a calendar year, shall be chaired by a representative 
of the Chairmanship from 1 January to 30 September and by a represen-
tative of the incoming Chairmanship from 1 October to 31 December; 
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(b) The Contact Group with the Mediterranean Partners for Co-operation 
shall be chaired by a representative of the incoming Chairmanship; 

(c) The Contact Group with the Asian Partners for Co-operation shall be 
chaired by a representative of the preceding Chairmanship; 

(d) The OSCE Communications Group shall be chaired, on behalf of the 
Chairmanship, by a representative of the OSCE Secretary General. 

 

3. The agenda for the meetings of an ISB shall be prepared and issued in ad-
vance by its Chairperson, who shall include in the agenda an appropriate 
item, such as “any other business”, under which Representatives may raise 
any issue. The Chairperson may include additional items in the agenda if so 
requested by a Representative before or at the beginning of the meeting. 
 

4. There shall be no official records kept for the meetings of ISBs. The 
Chairperson of an ISB may issue informal summaries or reports of the meet-
ings unless otherwise laid down in the ISB’s terms of reference. 
 

5. The meetings of ISBs shall not, as a rule, be provided with interpretation 
between the working languages. Subject to availability of resources and in 
accordance with relevant provisions of paragraph (43) of Chapter V of the 
1992 Helsinki Decisions, the Chairperson of the relevant superior decision-
making body may decide otherwise for certain ISB meetings. 
 

6. Unless otherwise decided for certain ISBs by the relevant superior 
decision-making body, representatives of the OSCE PA and of executive 
structures may attend and observe the meetings of the following ISBs: 
PrepComm, ACMF, EESC, both Contact Groups, Working Groups A and B. 
They shall not participate in the drafting of documents, but may comment on 
drafts or on other matters that directly concern them, and are related to the 
items on the agenda, upon invitation of the Chairperson. 
 

7. Unless otherwise decided for certain ISBs by the relevant superior 
decision-making body, the Partners for Co-operation may attend the meetings 
of the following ISBs, without the right to participate in the drafting of 
documents: 
 

(a) Japan – PrepComm, EESC, Working Groups A and B, Contact Group 
with the Asian Partners for Co-operation; 

(b) Other Partners for Co-operation – their respective Contact Groups. 
 

8. The relevant superior decision-making body may decide to invite the 
OSCE PA and the Partners for Co-operation to the meetings of ISBs that are 
not listed in paragraphs 6 and 7 above. The Chairperson of an ISB may in-
vite, on a case-by-case basis, representatives of the OSCE PA and Partners 
for Co-operation to certain meetings of that ISB, where such attendance is 
not already stipulated by paragraphs 6 and 7 above. 
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9. The meetings of ISBs shall be closed to the press and the public. The 
Chairperson of an ISB may invite representatives of relevant international 
organizations and guest speakers to certain meetings of that ISB on a case-
by-case basis and without the right to participate in the drafting of docu-
ments. 
 
(B) Informal working groups 
 
1. The work of an IWG shall be co-ordinated by its Chairperson, who shall be 
appointed by and be accountable to and shall report to its superior authority, 
as set out in paragraph II(A)9. 
 

2. There shall be no official records kept for the meetings of IWGs. The 
Chairperson of an IWG may issue informal summaries or reports of the 
meetings unless otherwise laid down in its terms of reference. 
 

3. The meetings of IWGs shall not, as a rule, be provided with interpretation 
between the working languages. 
 

4. Representatives of the OSCE PA and of executive structures may attend 
and observe the meetings of IWGs. They shall not participate in the drafting 
of documents, but may comment on drafts or on other matters that directly 
concern them, and are related to the items on the agenda, upon invitation of 
the Chairperson. 
 

5. The Chairperson of an IWG may invite Partners for Co-operation, repre-
sentatives of relevant international organizations and guest speakers to certain 
meetings of that IWG on a case-by-case basis. The meetings of IWGs shall 
be closed to the press and the public. 
 
 
VI. Conferences, Seminars, Workshops and Other Meetings 
 
(A) OSCE meetings 
 
1. OSCE meetings shall not have a decision-making capacity, as specified in 
paragraph II(A)1 and shall be open to all the participating States. Documents 
produced at such meetings shall not be considered as OSCE documents, as 
defined in paragraph II(A)3. 
 

2. The participating States shall adopt decisions regarding the time, venue, 
theme(s), agenda, timetable and organizational modalities for each OSCE 
meeting or for a series of OSCE meetings. Unless otherwise laid down in 
those decisions, the following general rules of procedure shall be applied at 
the OSCE meetings: 
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(a) All plenary sessions shall be conducted with interpretation between the 
working languages. Exceptionally, the chairperson may suggest, giving 
a clear explanation of reasons, that, with the consent of the participating 
States, a part of a meeting conducted outside of the agreed timetable 
should be held in one language only, without interpretation. 

(b) The chairperson or moderator shall ensure the good order and smooth 
running of meetings. 

(c) All participants shall have equal access to the list of speakers. The order 
of statements shall be determined by the chairperson or moderator ac-
cording to the order of requests for the floor. Such requests may be 
communicated to the chairperson in advance unless a certain time is set 
for the opening of the list of speakers. The chairperson or moderator 
may change the order of statements if necessary. 

(d) During a meeting, the chairperson or moderator may declare the list of 
speakers closed. If a statement made after the closure of the list of 
speakers makes desirable a reply by a Representative, the chairperson or 
moderator shall accord the right of reply to that Representative, at 
his/her request. 

(e) If a Representative wishes to raise a point of order, he/she shall com-
municate that wish to the chairperson or moderator, and the latter shall 
give him/her the floor immediately. A Representative raising a point of 
order may not speak on the substance of the matter under discussion. 

(f) Statements shall be limited in time. The chairperson or moderator may 
establish and change the time limit for statements. 

(g) The OSCE PA and the Partners for Co-operation shall be invited to at-
tend and make both oral and written contributions at OSCE meetings. 

(h) Official records (standard OSCE journals, as specified in chapter 
IV.1(B)) shall be kept and issued for the following regular OSCE 
meetings: Review Conferences, Annual Security Review Conferences 
(ASRC), Annual Implementation Assessment Meetings (AIAM), Eco-
nomic and Environmental Forums (EEF) and Human Dimension Im-
plementation Meetings (HDIM). 

(i) A report or summary of an OSCE meeting may be issued by the Chair-
manship, the FSC Chairmanship or a relevant executive structure, as 
appropriate. 

 
(B) Meetings organized by the Chairmanship, the FSC Chairmanship or an 

executive structure 
 
1. An OSCE-related conference, seminar, workshop or other open meeting 
which is held by the Chairmanship, the FSC Chairmanship or an executive 
structure without a specific decision of the participating States shall not be 
referred to as an OSCE meeting. The organizers of such meetings shall not be 
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required to apply the rules of procedure set out in sub-paragraphs (a) to (i) of 
paragraph VI(A)2 above. 
 

2. Such meetings shall not have a decision-making capacity, as specified in 
paragraph II(A)1, and shall be open to all the participating States. Documents 
produced at such meetings shall not be considered as OSCE documents, as 
defined in paragraph II(A)3.  
 

3. The host(s) or organizer(s) of such meetings shall, as appropriate, inform 
the participating States about the time, venue, theme(s), agenda, timetable 
and organizational modalities of the meeting concerned, and provide the par-
ticipating States with its report or summary. 
 
 
VII. Final Provisions 
 
1. These rules of procedure shall complement provisions of OSCE documents 
adopted earlier. In case of contradiction with OSCE documents adopted earl-
ier, the rules of procedure contained in this document shall take precedence. 
 

2. Pursuant to paragraph IV.1(A)9, the PC and FSC may decide, within their 
respective competencies, whenever necessary, to recommend to the Minister-
ial Council amendments to these rules of procedure. The Ministerial Council 
will decide whether to adopt the amendments recommended, if necessary 
through the application of the procedure set out in Annex 1(B), and will issue 
revised rules of procedure, as appropriate.  
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Annex 1 
 
(A) Application of a Silence Procedure in the Permanent Council and the 

Forum for Security Co-operation 
 
1. The Chairperson may suggest the adoption of a decision through a silence 
procedure. Such a suggestion shall be made during a meeting, with an indi-
cation of the exact time for the expiration of the period of silence. If there is 
no objection expressed by a Representative at that meeting, the decision shall 
be regarded as placed under a silence procedure. 
 

2. Immediately after that meeting, the Secretariat shall issue an interim text of 
the decision without a number and with a temporary title reflecting the fact 
that the decision is subject to a silence procedure. The interim text shall be 
appended to the journal of that meeting. 
 

3. The silence shall be regarded as broken if an objection or an amendment 
has been communicated by a participating State to the Chairperson in writing 
before the expiration of the silence period. In this case, the Chairperson shall 
immediately inform the participating States in writing that the decision in 
question has not been adopted. 
 

4. If the silence has not been broken, the Chairperson, immediately after the 
expiration of the silence period, shall inform the participating States in writ-
ing that the decision in question has been adopted. The text of the decision 
shall not be issued until the next meeting. If urgent administrative actions are 
to be taken on the basis of that decision, the Chairperson may send the text of 
the decision to a relevant executive structure strictly for internal use. 
 

5. At the first meeting following the adoption of the decision, the Chairperson 
shall make an announcement concerning the adoption of the decision. 
 

6. Immediately after that meeting, the decision, with interpretative statements 
and formal reservations attached, if any, shall be issued by the Secretariat in a 
standard OSCE format and appended to the journal of that meeting. The date 
of the expiration of the silence period shall be regarded as the date of adop-
tion of the decision. 
 
(B) Procedure for Adopting Ministerial Council Decisions in the Period 

Between Meetings of the Ministerial Council 
 
1. The Chairmanship shall circulate the text of a draft Ministerial Council de-
cision to the participating States. After consensus has been reached or ap-
proached on the draft Ministerial Council decision, the Chairmanship shall 
issue a draft PC decision, hereinafter referred to as a PC recommendation, on 
forwarding the decision in question to the Ministerial Council and recom-
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mending its adoption through a silence procedure. This draft PC decision 
may also contain a recommendation regarding the exact time of the expir-
ation of the period of silence. 
 

2. The PC shall, as a rule, adopt its recommendation without putting it under 
a silence procedure. If, nevertheless, a silence procedure is applied for the PC 
recommendation, then the next step (paragraph 3 below) shall be postponed 
until the expiration of the PC’s period of silence, which shall be regarded as 
the date of entry into force of the PC recommendation. 
 

3. Immediately after the entry into force of the PC recommendation, the 
Chairman-in-Office (CiO) shall circulate a letter to the other members of the 
Ministerial Council, which shall announce a silence procedure on the draft 
Ministerial Council decision and shall be sent as a restricted document, with 
the draft Ministerial Council decision attached, through the OSCE delega-
tions in Vienna. This letter shall fix the exact time for the expiration of the 
silence period, which shall not be earlier than five days following the date of 
the circulation of the letter. 
 

4. The silence shall be regarded as broken if an objection or amendment has 
been communicated by a participating State to the Chairmanship in writing 
before the expiration of the silence period. In this case, the Chairmanship 
shall immediately inform the participating States in writing that the decision 
in question has not been adopted. 
 

5. If the silence has not been broken, the CiO shall circulate, immediately 
after the expiration of the silence period, a letter to the other members of the 
Ministerial Council announcing the adoption of the Ministerial Council deci-
sion. The text of the Ministerial Council decision shall not be issued until the 
next PC meeting. 
 

6. At the first PC meeting following the adoption of the Ministerial Council 
decision, the Chairperson of the PC shall make an announcement about the 
adoption of the Ministerial Council decision. 
 

7. Immediately after that PC meeting, the Ministerial Council decision, with 
the interpretative statements and formal reservations attached, if any, shall be 
issued by the Secretariat in a standard OSCE format and appended to the 
journal of that PC meeting. The date of the expiration of the silence period 
shall be regarded as the date of adoption of the Ministerial Council decision. 
The text of the CiO’s letter mentioned in paragraph 5 above shall be annexed 
to the journal of that PC meeting, for the record. 
 

8. At the first Ministerial Council meeting following the adoption of the 
Ministerial Council decision, the CiO shall announce that the decision has 
been adopted through a silence procedure, and the decision, with the inter-
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pretative statements and formal reservations attached, if any, shall be ap-
pended to the journal of that Ministerial Council meeting. 
 

* * * * * 
 

9. The Ministerial Council may place draft decisions under a silence proced-
ure at the meetings of the Ministerial Council. In this case, the consecutive 
procedure set out in paragraphs (A)1-2 and (B)4-8 of Annex 1 shall be ap-
plied. 
 
 
Annex 2 
 
Provisions Related to Paragraph II(A)2 
 
Paragraph II(A)2 shall apply without prejudice to the following provisions of 
earlier adopted CSCE/OSCE documents:  
 

- Paragraph 16 of Chapter IV of the Prague Document on Further Devel-
opment of CSCE Institutions and Structures (1992), 

- Paragraph 4 (d) of the Decisions of the Third Meeting of the Council 
(Stockholm, 1992), 

- Decision on Peaceful Settlement of Disputes (Stockholm, 1992). 
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Attachment 1 
 
Interpretative Statement under Paragraph IV.1(A)6 of the OSCE Rules of 
Procedure 
 
By the delegation of Ukraine: 
 
“In connection with the adoption of the OSCE Rules of Procedure, we would 
like to make the following interpretative statement under paragraph IV.1(A)6 
of the OSCE Rules of Procedure. 

Ukraine has joined the consensus on the Rules or Procedure of the Or-
ganization for Security and Co-operation in Europe and welcomes the adop-
tion of that document. We understand that paragraph IV.1(A)6 and both sec-
tions of Annex 1 of the OSCE Rules of Procedure reflect past and existing 
CSCE/OSCE practice with regard to formal reservations and interpretative 
statements. 

Our understanding of this practice and of the adopted rules is that pos-
sible formal reservations or interpretative statements concerning given deci-
sions are delivered orally during the meeting at which the decision in ques-
tion is adopted or, in cases where a silence procedure is applied in accordance 
with section (A) or section (B) of Annex 1, at the first meeting following the 
successful expiration of the silence period, immediately after the Chairper-
son’s announcement about the adoption of the decision in question. 

It is also our understanding that no interpretative statements or formal 
reservations can be made by a participating State and circulated or registered 
by the Secretariat after the texts of decisions, with interpretative statements 
and formal reservations attached, if any, are circulated to the participating 
States in accordance with paragraph IV.1(B)6, paragraph 6 of Annex 1(A) 
and paragraph 7 of Annex 1(B). 

Mr. Chairperson, we ask for this interpretative statement to be duly 
registered by the Secretariat.” 
 
 
Attachment 2 
 
Interpretative Statement under Paragraph IV.1(A)6 of the OSCE Rules of 
Procedure 
 
By the delegation of the Russian Federation: 
 
“Having joined the consensus regarding the decision of the Ministerial Coun-
cil on the OSCE Rules of Procedure, we take the position that the adoption of 
this document signals a useful, even if modest, step in reforming the OSCE 
and in placing its work on a firm normative basis in the form of a single 

In: IFSH (ed.), OSCE Yearbook 2007, Baden-Baden 2008, pp. 351-421.



 376

compendium of clear and collectively agreed rules, as befits a fully fledged 
international organization.  

We believe that it will be necessary in the future to continue work on 
the codification of existing procedural practices within the OSCE, supple-
menting the Rules of Procedure adopted with provisions referring, inter alia, 
to the procedures governing the activities of OSCE institutions and field op-
erations.  

We would request that this statement be attached to the decision 
adopted and included as an annex to the journal of the day.” 
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Forms and Forums of Co-operation in the OSCE Area 
 
 
G8 (Group of Eight) 
Organization for Economic Co-operation and Development (OECD) 
 
Council of Europe (CoE) 
 
North Atlantic Treaty Organisation (NATO) 
Euro-Atlantic Partnership Council (EAPC) 
EAPC Observers 
Partnership for Peace (PfP) 
NATO-Russia Council 
NATO-Ukraine Charter/NATO-Ukraine Commission 
 
European Union (EU) 
EU Accession Negotiations 
EU Candidate Countries 
EU Association Agreements 
Stabilization and Association Process (SAP) 
Stabilization and Association Agreements (SAA) 
 
Western European Union (WEU) 
Associate Members of the WEU1 
Associate Partners of the WEU 
WEU Observers2 
Eurocorps 
 
Commonwealth of Independent States (CIS) 
 
Baltic Defence Council 
Barents Euro-Arctic Council 
Observers to the Barents Euro-Arctic Council 
Nordic Council 
Council of the Baltic Sea States (CBSS) 
 
Stability Pact for South Eastern Europe 
Observers to the Stability Pact for South Eastern Europe 
Central European Free Trade Agreement/Area (CEFTA) 
Central European Initiative (CEI) 

                                                           
1  The WEU does not differentiate between associate and full members. 
2  Observer status confers privileges restricted to information exchange and attendance at 

meetings in individual cases and on invitation. 
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Southeast European Co-operative Initiative (SECI) 
South Eastern European Co-operation Process (SEECP) 
SEECP Observers 
Black Sea Economic Co-operation (BSEC) 
 
North American Free Trade Area (NAFTA) 
 
Collective Security Treaty Organization (CSTO) 
 
Shanghai Cooperation Organization (SCO) 
 
Sources: 
OECD: www.oecd.org 
Council of Europe: www.coe.int 
NATO: www.nato.int 
EU: europa.eu 
WEU: www.weu.int 
Baltic Defence Council: www.baltasam.org 
Barents Euro-Arctic Council: www.beac.st 
Nordic Council: www.norden.org 
CBSS: www.cbss.st 
Stability Pact for South Eastern Europe: www.stabilitypact.org 
CEFTA: www.stabilitypact.org/wt2/TradeCEFTA2006.asp 
CEI: www.ceinet.org 
SECI: www.secicenter.org 
BSEC: www.bsec-organization.org 
NAFTA: www.nafta-sec-alena.org 
CSTO: www.dkb.gov.ru 
SCO: www.sectsco.org 
 
 

In: IFSH (ed.), OSCE Yearbook 2007, Baden-Baden 2008, pp. 351-421.



 379

The 56 OSCE Participating States – Facts and Figures1 
 
 
1. Albania 
Date of accession: June 1991 
Scale of contributions: 0.125 per cent (OSCE ranking: 40)2  
Area: 28,748 km² (OSCE ranking: 45)3  
Population: 3,581,655 (OSCE ranking: 41)4  
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates5: 5,700 (OSCE ranking: 
46)6  
GDP growth: 5 per cent (OSCE ranking: 27)7  
Armed forces (active): 11,020 (OSCE ranking: 38)8  
Memberships and forms of co-operation: CoE (1995), EAPC, PfP (1994), 
SAA (2006), Stability Pact for South Eastern Europe, CEFTA, CEI (1995), 
SECI, SEECP, BSEC. 
 
2. Andorra 
Date of accession: April 1996 
Scale of contributions: 0.125 per cent (40) 
Area: 468 km² (51) 
Population: 71,201 (52) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 38,800 (5)9  
GDP growth: 3.5 per cent (37)10  
Armed forces (active): none 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: CoE (1994). 
 
3. Armenia 
Date of accession: January 1992 
Scale of contributions: 0.05 per cent (49) 
Area: 29,800 km² (44) 
Population: 2,976,372 (42) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 5,700 (46) 
GDP growth: 13.4 per cent (2) 
                                                           
1  Compiled by Jochen Rasch. 
2  Of 55 states. 
3  Of 56 states. 
4  Of 56 states. 
5  The international dollar is the hypothetical unit of currency used to compare different 

national currencies in terms of purchasing power parity. PPP is defined as the number of 
units of a country’s currency required to buy the same amounts of goods and services in 
the domestic market as one US dollar would buy in the United States. See The World 
Bank, World Development Report 2002, Washington, D.C., 2002. 

6  Of 48 states. 
7  Of 55 states. 
8  Of 54 states. 
9  2005. 
10  2005 (estimated). 
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Armed forces (active): 43,641 (21) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: CoE (2001), EAPC, PfP (1994), 
CIS (1991), BSEC, CSTO. 
 
4. Austria 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 2.33 per cent (13) 
Area: 83,870 km² (29) 
Population: 8,192,880 (24) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 34,700 (9) 
GDP growth: 3.3 per cent (39) 
Armed forces (active): 39,600 (24) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: OECD (1961), CoE (1956), EAPC, 
PfP (1995), EU (1995), WEU Observer (1995), Stability Pact for South 
Eastern Europe, CEI (1989). 
 
5. Azerbaijan 
Date of accession: January 1992 
Scale of contributions: 0.05 per cent (49) 
Area: 86,600 km² (28) 
Population: 7,961,619 (25) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 7,500 (45) 
GDP growth: 34.5 per cent (1) 
Armed forces (active): 66,740 (14) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: CoE (2001), EAPC, PfP (1994), 
CIS (1991), BSEC. 
 
6. Belarus 
Date of accession: January 1992 
Scale of contributions: 0.31 per cent (30) 
Area: 207,600 km² (19) 
Population: 10,293,011 (19) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 8,100 (43) 
GDP growth: 9.9 per cent (8) 
Armed forces (active): 72,940 (12) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: EAPC, PfP (1995), CIS (1991), CEI 
(1995), CSTO. 
 
7. Belgium 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 3.34 per cent (11) 
Area: 30,528 km² (43) 
Population: 10,379,067 (18) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 33,000 (13) 
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GDP growth: 3 per cent (41) 
Armed forces (active): 39,690 (22) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: OECD (1961), CoE (1949), NATO 
(1949), EAPC, EU (1958), WEU (1954), Eurocorps (1993), Stability Pact for 
South Eastern Europe. 
 
8. Bosnia and Herzegovina 
Date of accession: April 1992 
Scale of contributions: 0.125 per cent (40) 
Area: 51,129 km² (36) 
Population: 4,498,976 (36) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 5,600 (48) 
GDP growth: 6.2 per cent (18) 
Armed forces (active): 11,865 (36) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: CoE (2002), EAPC, SAP, Stability 
Pact for South Eastern Europe, CEFTA, CEI (1992), SECI, SEECP. 
 
9. Bulgaria 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 0.55 per cent (26) 
Area: 110,910 km² (23) 
Population: 7,385,367 (27) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 10,700 (37) 
GDP growth: 6.1 per cent (20) 
Armed forces (active): 51,000 (19) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: CoE (1992), NATO (2004), EAPC, 
PfP (1994), EU (2007), Associate Partner of the WEU (1994), Stability Pact 
for South Eastern Europe, CEI (1995), SECI, SEECP, BSEC. 
 
10. Canada 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 5.53 per cent (7) 
Area: 9,984,670 km² (2) 
Population: 33,098,932 (11) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 35,700 (8) 
GDP growth: 2.8 per cent (45) 
Armed forces (active): 62,500 (16) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: G8 (1976), OECD (1961), NATO 
(1949), EAPC, Observer of the Barents Euro-Arctic Council, Stability Pact 
for South Eastern Europe, NAFTA. 
 
11. Croatia 
Date of accession: March 1992 
Scale of contributions: 0.19 per cent (33) 
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Area: 56,542 km² (35) 
Population: 4,494,749 (37) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 13,400 (35) 
GDP growth: 4.8 per cent (29) 
Armed forces (active): 20,800 (32) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: CoE (1996), EAPC, PfP (2000), EU 
Accession Negotiations (2004), SAA (2001), Stability Pact for South Eastern 
Europe, CEFTA, CEI (1992), SECI, SEECP. 
 
12. Cyprus 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 0.19 per cent (33) 
Area: 9,250 km² (49)11  
Population: 784,301 (47)12  
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 23,000 (25) 
GDP growth: 10.6 per cent (6) 
Armed forces (active): Greek sector: 10,000 , Turkish sector: 5,000 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: CoE (1961), EU (2004), Stability 
Pact for South Eastern Europe. 
 
13. Czech Republic 
Date of accession: January 1993 
Scale of contributions: 0.6 per cent (23) 
Area: 78,866 km² (30) 
Population: 10,235,455 (20) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 22,000 (26) 
GDP growth: 6.4 per cent (17) 
Armed forces (active): 24,752 (29) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: OECD (1995), CoE (1993), NATO 
(1999), EAPC, PfP (1994), EU (2004), Associate Member of the WEU 
(1999), Stability Pact for South Eastern Europe, CEI (1990/1993). 
 
14. Denmark 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 2.02 per cent (15) 
Area: 43,094 km² (39) 
Population: 5,450,661 (29) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 37,100 (7) 
GDP growth: 3.5 per cent (37) 
Armed forces (active): 21,620 (31) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: OECD (1961), CoE (1949), NATO 
(1949), EAPC, EU (1973), WEU Observer (1992), Barents Euro-Arctic 
                                                           
11  Greek sector: 5,895 km², Turkish sector: 3,355 km². 
12  Total of Greek and Turkish sectors. 
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Council, Nordic Council (1952), CBSS (1992), Stability Pact for South 
Eastern Europe. 
 
15. Estonia 
Date of accession: September 1991 
Scale of contributions: 0.19 per cent (33) 
Area: 45,226 km² (38) 
Population: 1,324,333 (46) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 20,300 (28) 
GDP growth: 11.4 per cent (4) 
Armed forces (active): 4,100 (47) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: CoE (1993), NATO (2004), EAPC, 
PfP (1994), EU (2004), Associate Partner of the WEU (1994), Baltic Defence 
Council, CBSS (1992), Stability Pact for South Eastern Europe. 
 
16. Finland 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 1.92 per cent (16) 
Area: 338,145 km² (13) 
Population: 5,231,372 (31) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 33,500 (12) 
GDP growth: 4.9 per cent (28) 
Armed forces (active): 29,300 (26) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: OECD (1969), CoE (1989), EAPC, 
PfP (1994), EU (1995), WEU Observer (1995), Barents Euro-Arctic Council, 
Nordic Council (1956), CBSS (1992), Stability Pact for South Eastern 
Europe. 
 
17. France 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 9.35 per cent (2) 
Area: 643,427 km² (6) 
Population: 60,876,136 (5) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 31,200 (18) 
GDP growth: 2.2 per cent (51) 
Armed forces (active): 254,895 (4) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: G8 (1975), OECD (1961), CoE 
(1949), NATO (1949), EAPC, EU (1958), WEU (1954), Eurocorps (1992), 
Observer of the Barents Euro-Arctic Council, Stability Pact for South Eastern 
Europe. 
 
18. Georgia 
Date of accession: March 1992 
Scale of contributions: 0.05 per cent (49) 
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Area: 69,700 km² (32) 
Population: 4,661,473 (34) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 3,900 (50) 
GDP growth: 9.4 per cent (9) 
Armed forces (active): 11,320 (37) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: CoE (1999), EAPC, PfP (1994), 
CIS (1993), BSEC. 
 
19. Germany 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 9.35 per cent (2) 
Area: 357,021 km² (12) 
Population: 82,422,299 (3) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 31,900 (16) 
GDP growth: 2.8 per cent (45) 
Armed forces (active): 245,702 (5) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: G8 (1975), OECD (1961), CoE 
(1950), NATO (1955), EAPC, EU (1958), WEU (1954), Eurocorps (1992), 
Observer of the Barents Euro-Arctic Council, CBSS (1992), Stability Pact for 
South Eastern Europe. 
 
20. Greece 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 0.98 per cent (19) 
Area: 131,940 km² (22) 
Population: 10,688,058 (16) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 24,000 (23) 
GDP growth: 4.3 per cent (33) 
Armed forces (active): 147,100 (10) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: OECD (1961), CoE (1949), NATO 
(1952), EAPC, EU (1981), WEU (1995), Stability Pact for South Eastern 
Europe, SECI, SEECP, BSEC. 
 
21. Holy See, The 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 0.125 per cent (40) 
Area: 0.44 km² (56) 
Population: 800 (56) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: n/a 
GDP growth: n/a 
Armed forces (active): 013 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: none. 
                                                           
13  Authorized strength 100-110 members of the Swiss Guard, cf. at: http://www.vatican.va/ 

roman_curia/swiss_guard/500_swiss/documents/rc_gsp_20060121_informazioni_it.html. 
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22. Hungary 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 0.6 per cent (23) 
Area: 93,030 km² (25) 
Population: 9,981,334 (21) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 17,500 (31) 
GDP growth: 3.9 per cent (35) 
Armed forces (active): 32,300 (25) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: OECD (1996), CoE (1990), NATO 
(1999), EAPC, PfP (1994), EU (2004), Associate Member of the WEU 
(1999), Stability Pact for South Eastern Europe, CEI (1989), SECI. 
 
23. Iceland 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 0.19 per cent (33) 
Area: 103,000 km² (24) 
Population: 299,388 (51) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 38,000 (6) 
GDP growth: 2.6 per cent (50) 
Armed forces (active): none 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: OECD (1961), CoE (1950), NATO 
(1949), EAPC, EU Association Agreement (1996), Associate Member of the 
WEU (1992), Barents Euro-Arctic Council, Nordic Council (1952), CBSS 
(1995). 
 
24. Ireland 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 0.75 per cent (21) 
Area: 70,280 km² (31) 
Population: 4,062,235 (39) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 44,500 (3) 
GDP growth: 5.7 per cent (25) 
Armed forces (active): 10,470 (40) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: OECD (1961), CoE (1949), EAPC, 
PfP (1999), EU (1973), WEU Observer (1992), Stability Pact for South 
Eastern Europe. 
 
25. Italy 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 9.35 per cent (2) 
Area: 301,230 km² (16) 
Population: 58,133,509 (7) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 30,200 (19) 
GDP growth: 1.9 per cent (52) 
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Armed forces (active): 191,152 (6) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: G8 (1975), OECD (1961), CoE 
(1949), NATO (1949), EAPC, EU (1958), WEU (1954), Observer of the 
Barents Euro-Arctic Council, Stability Pact for South Eastern Europe, CEI 
(1989). 
 
26. Kazakhstan 
Date of accession: January 1992 
Scale of contributions: 0.36 per cent (28) 
Area: 2,717,300 km² (4) 
Population: 15,233,244 (15) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 9,400 (38) 
GDP growth: 10.6 per cent (6) 
Armed forces (active): 65,800 (15) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: EAPC, PfP (1994), CIS (1991), 
CSTO, SCO. 
 
27. Kyrgyzstan 
Date of accession: January 1992 
Scale of contributions: 0.05 per cent (49) 
Area: 198,500 km² (20) 
Population: 5,213,898 (32) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 2,100 (52) 
GDP growth: 2.7 per cent (48) 
Armed forces (active): 12,500 (34) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: EAPC, PfP (1994), CIS (1991), 
CSTO, SCO. 
 
28. Latvia 
Date of accession: September 1991 
Scale of contributions: 0.19 per cent (33) 
Area: 64,589 km² (34) 
Population: 2,274,735 (43) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 16,000 (32) 
GDP growth: 11.9 per cent (3) 
Armed forces (active): 5,339 (45) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: CoE (1995), NATO (2004), EAPC, 
PfP (1994), EU (2004), Associate Partner of the WEU (1994), Baltic Defence 
Council, CBSS (1992), Stability Pact for South Eastern Europe. 
 
29. Liechtenstein 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 0.125 per cent (40) 
Area: 160 km² (53) 
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Population: 33,987 (53) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 25,000 (22)14  
GDP growth: 11 per cent (5)15  
Armed forces (active): none16 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: CoE (1978), EU Association 
Agreement (1995), since 1923 Community of Law, Economy, and Currency 
with Switzerland. 
 
30. Lithuania 
Date of accession: September 1991 
Scale of contributions: 0.19 per cent (33) 
Area: 65,200 km² (33) 
Population: 3,585,906 (40) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 15,300 (33) 
GDP growth: 7.5 per cent (12) 
Armed forces (active): 12,010 (35) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: CoE (1993), NATO (2004), EAPC, 
PfP (1994), EU (2004), Associate Partner of the WEU (1994), Baltic Defence 
Council, CBSS (1992), Stability Pact for South Eastern Europe. 
 
31. Luxembourg 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 0.47 per cent (27) 
Area: 2,586 km² (50) 
Population: 474,413 (49) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 71,400 (1) 
GDP growth: 6.2 per cent (18) 
Armed forces (active): 900 (49) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: OECD (1961), CoE (1949), NATO 
(1949), EAPC, EU (1958), WEU (1954), Eurocorps (1996), Stability Pact for 
South Eastern Europe. 
 
32. Macedonia, The Former Yugoslav Republic of 
Date of accession: October 1995 
Scale of contributions: 0.125 per cent (40) 
Area: 25,333 km² (46) 
Population: 2,050,554 (44) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 8,300 (42) 
GDP growth: 3.1 per cent (40) 
Armed forces (active): 10,890 (39) 

                                                           
14  1999 (estimated). 
15  1999 (estimated). 
16  In 1868, the armed forces were dissolved, cf. at: http://www.liechtenstein.li/pdf-fl-

multimedia-information-liechtenstein-bildschirm.pdf. 
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Memberships and forms of co-operation: CoE (1995), EAPC, PfP (1995), EU 
Accession Negotiations (2005), SAP, SAA (2001), Stability Pact for South 
Eastern Europe, CEFTA, CEI (1993), SECI, SEECP. 
 
33. Malta 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 0.125 per cent (40) 
Area: 316 km² (52) 
Population: 400,214 (50) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 21,300 (27) 
GDP growth: 2.9 per cent (43) 
Armed forces (active): 1,609 (48) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: CoE (1965), EU (2004), Stability 
Pact for South Eastern Europe. 
 
34. Moldova 
Date of accession: January 1992 
Scale of contributions: 0.05 per cent (49) 
Area: 33,843 km² (42) 
Population: 4,466,706 (38) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 2,000 (53) 
GDP growth: 4 per cent (34) 
Armed forces (active): 6,750 (43) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: CoE (1995), EAPC, PfP (1994), 
CIS (1991), Stability Pact for South Eastern Europe, CEFTA, CEI (1996), 
SECI, SEECP, BSEC. 
 
35. Monaco 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 0.125 per cent (40) 
Area: 2.00 km² (55) 
Population: 32,543 (54) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 30,000 (20) 
GDP growth: 0.9 per cent (54)17  
Armed forces (active): none 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: CoE (2004), Member of the 
European Economic and Monetary Space by special agreement with France. 
 
36. Montenegro 
Date of accession: June 2006 
Scale of contributions: http://www,osce,org/item/19722,html?lc=DE per cent 
Area: 14,026 km² (48) 
Population: 630,548 (48) 
                                                           
17  2000 (estimated). 
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GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 3,800 (51)18  
GDP growth: n/a 
Armed forces (active): 7,300 (42) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: CoE (2007), EAPC, PfP (2006), 
SAP, Stability Pact for South Eastern Europe, CEFTA, CEI (2006). 
 
37. Netherlands 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 4.16 per cent (9) 
Area: 41,526 km² (40) 
Population: 16,491,461 (14) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 32,100 (15) 
GDP growth: 3 per cent (41) 
Armed forces (active): 53,130 (18) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: OECD (1961), CoE (1949), NATO 
(1949), EAPC, EU (1958), WEU (1954), Observer of the Barents Euro-
Arctic Council, Stability Pact for South Eastern Europe. 
 
38. Norway 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 2.15 per cent (14) 
Area: 323,802 km² (14) 
Population: 4,610,820 (35) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 46,300 (2) 
GDP growth: 4.6 per cent (30) 
Armed forces (active): 23,400 (30) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: OECD (1961), CoE (1949), NATO 
(1949), EAPC, EU Association Agreement (1996), Associate Member of the 
WEU (1992), Barents Euro-Arctic Council, Nordic Council (1952), CBSS 
(1992), Stability Pact for South Eastern Europe. 
 
39. Poland 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 1.34 per cent (17) 
Area: 312,685 km² (15) 
Population: 38,536,869 (10) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 14,400 (34) 
GDP growth: 6.1 per cent (20) 
Armed forces (active): 141,500 (11) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: OECD (1996), CoE (1991), NATO 
(1999), EAPC, PfP (1994), EU (2004), Associate Member of the WEU 
(1999), Observer of the Barents Euro-Arctic Council, CBSS (1992), Stability 
Pact for South Eastern Europe, CEI (1991). 
                                                           
18  2005 (estimated). 
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40. Portugal 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 0.98 per cent (19) 
Area: 92,391 km² (26) 
Population: 10,605,870 (17) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 19,800 (29) 
GDP growth: 1.3 per cent (53) 
Armed forces (active): 43,960 (20) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: OECD (1961), CoE (1976), NATO 
(1949), EAPC, EU (1986), WEU (1990), Stability Pact for South Eastern 
Europe. 
 
41. Romania 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 0.6 per cent (23) 
Area: 237,500 km² (18) 
Population: 22,303,552 (13) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 9,100 (39) 
GDP growth: 7.7 per cent (11) 
Armed forces (active): 69,600 (13) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: CoE (1993), NATO (2004), EAPC, 
PfP (1994), EU (2007), Associate Partner of the WEU (1994), Stability Pact 
for South Eastern Europe, CEI (1995), SECI, SEECP, BSEC. 
 
42. Russian Federation 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 6.5 per cent (6) 
Area: 17,075,200 km² (1) 
Population: 142,893,540 (2) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 12,200 (36) 
GDP growth: 6.7 per cent (16) 
Armed forces (active): 1,027,000 (2) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: G8 (1998), CoE (1996), EAPC, PfP 
(1994), NATO-Russia Council (2002), CIS (1991), Barents Euro-Arctic 
Council, CBSS (1992), Stability Pact for South Eastern Europe, BSEC, 
CSTO, SCO. 
 
43. San Marino 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 0.125 per cent (40) 
Area: 61 km² (54) 
Population: 29,251 (55) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 34,100 (10)19  
                                                           
19  2004 (estimated). 
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GDP growth: 4.6 per cent (30)20  
Armed forces (active): none 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: CoE (1988). 
 
44. Serbia 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 0.19 per cent (33) 
Area: 88,361 km² (27) 
Population: 9,396,411 (22) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 4,400 (49)21  
GDP growth: 5.9 per cent (24)22  
Armed forces (active): 39,686 (23) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: CoE (2003), EAPC, PfP (2006), 
SAP, Stability Pact for South Eastern Europe, CEFTA, CEI (1989/2000), 
SECI, SEECP, BSEC. 
 
45. Slovakia 
Date of accession: January 1993 
Scale of contributions: 0.28 per cent (31) 
Area: 48,845 km² (37) 
Population: 5,439,448 (30) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 18,200 (30) 
GDP growth: 8.3 per cent (10) 
Armed forces (active): 15,223 (33) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: OECD (2000), CoE (1993), NATO 
(2004), EAPC, PfP (1994), EU (2004), Associate Partner of the WEU (1994), 
Stability Pact for South Eastern Europe, CEI (1990/1993). 
 
46. Slovenia 
Date of accession: March 1992 
Scale of contributions: 0.2 per cent (32) 
Area: 20,273 km² (47) 
Population: 2,010,347 (45) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 23,400 (24) 
GDP growth: 5.2 per cent (26) 
Armed forces (active): 6,550 (44) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: CoE (1993), NATO (2004), EAPC, 
PfP (1994), EU (2004), Associate Partner of the WEU (1996), Stability Pact 
for South Eastern Europe, CEI (1992), SECI. 

                                                           
20  2004 (estimated). 
21  2005 (estimated). 
22  2005 (estimated). 
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47. Spain 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 4.58 per cent (8) 
Area: 504,782 km² (8) 
Population: 40,397,842 (9) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 27,400 (21) 
GDP growth: 3.9 per cent (35) 
Armed forces (active): 147,255 (9) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: OECD (1961), CoE (1977), NATO 
(1982), EAPC, EU (1986), WEU (1990), Eurocorps (1994), Stability Pact for 
South Eastern Europe. 
 
48. Sweden 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 3.37 per cent (10) 
Area: 449,964 km² (10) 
Population: 9,016,596 (23) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 32,200 (14) 
GDP growth: 4.5 per cent (32) 
Armed forces (active): 27,600 (27) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: OECD (1961), CoE (1949), EAPC, 
PfP (1994), EU (1995), WEU Observer (1995), Barents Euro-Arctic Council, 
Nordic Council (1952), CBSS (1992), Stability Pact for South Eastern 
Europe. 
 
49. Switzerland 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 2.81 per cent (12) 
Area: 41,290 km² (41) 
Population: 7,523,934 (26) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 34,000 (11) 
GDP growth: 2.7 per cent (48) 
Armed forces (active): 4,200 (46) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: OECD (1961), CoE (1963), EAPC, 
PfP (1996), EU Association Agreement (rejected by referendum), Stability 
Pact for South Eastern Europe. 
 
50. Tajikistan 
Date of accession: January 1992 
Scale of contributions: 0.05 per cent (49) 
Area: 143,100 km² (21) 
Population: 7,320,815 (28) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 1,300 (55) 
GDP growth: 7 per cent (15) 
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Armed forces (active): 7,600 (41) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: EAPC, PfP (2002), CIS (1991), 
CSTO, SCO. 
 
51. Turkey 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 1.01 per cent (18) 
Area: 780,580 km² (5) 
Population: 70,413,958 (4) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 9,100 (39) 
GDP growth: 6.1 per cent (20) 
Armed forces (active): 514,850 (3) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: OECD (1961), CoE (1949), NATO 
(1952), EAPC, EU Accession Negotiations (2004), EU Candidate Country 
(1987), EU Association Agreement (1964), Associate Member of the WEU 
(1992), Stability Pact for South Eastern Europe, SECI, SEECP, BSEC. 
 
52. Turkmenistan 
Date of accession: January 1992 
Scale of contributions: 0.05 per cent (49) 
Area: 488,100 km² (9) 
Population: 5,042,920 (33) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 8,500 (41) 
GDP growth: 6 per cent (23) 
Armed forces (active): 26,000 (28) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: EAPC, PfP (1994), CIS (1991). 
 
53. Ukraine 
Date of accession: January 1992 
Scale of contributions: 0.71 per cent (22) 
Area: 603,700 km² (7) 
Population: 46,710,816 (8) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 7,800 (44) 
GDP growth: 7.1 per cent (14) 
Armed forces (active): 187,600 (8) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: CoE (1995), EAPC, PfP (1994), 
NATO-Ukraine Charter/NATO-Ukraine Commission (1997), CIS (1991), 
CEI (1995), BSEC. 
 
54. United Kingdom 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 9.35 per cent (2) 
Area: 244,820 km² (17) 
Population: 60,609,153 (6) 
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GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 31,800 (17) 
GDP growth: 2.8 per cent (45) 
Armed forces (active): 191,030 (7) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: G8 (1975), OECD (1961), CoE 
(1949), NATO (1949), EAPC, EU (1973), WEU (1954), Observer of the 
Barents Euro-Arctic Council, Stability Pact for South Eastern Europe. 
 
55. USA 
Date of accession: June 1973 
Scale of contributions: 11 per cent (1) 
Area: 9,826,630 km² (3) 
Population: 298,444,215 (1) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 43,800 (4) 
GDP growth: 2.9 per cent (43) 
Armed forces (active): 1,506,757 (1) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: G8 (1975), OECD (1961), NATO 
(1949), EAPC, Observer of the Barents Euro-Arctic Council, Stability Pact 
for South Eastern Europe, NAFTA. 
 
56. Uzbekistan 
Date of accession: January 1992 
Scale of contributions: 0.35 per cent (29) 
Area: 447,400 km² (11) 
Population: 27,307,134 (12) 
GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates: 2,000 (53) 
GDP growth: 7.3 per cent (13) 
Armed forces (active): 55,000 (17) 
Memberships and forms of co-operation: EAPC, PfP (1994), CIS (1991), 
CSTO, SCO. 
 
 
Sources: 
Date of accession: 
http://www.osce.org/about/13131.html 
Scale of contributions: 
http://www.osce.org/item/17501.html 
Area: 
https://www.cia.gov/library/publications/the-world-
factbook/rankorder/2147rank.txt 
Population (estimated as of July 2007): 
https://www.cia.gov/library/publications/the-world-
factbook/rankorder/2119rank.txt 
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GDP per capita in international dollars at PPP rates (estimated as of 2006, 
unless stated to the contrary): 
https://www.cia.gov/library/publications/the-world-
factbook/rankorder/2004rank.txt 
GDP growth (estimated as of 2006, unless stated to the contrary): 
http://www.cia.gov/cia/publications/factbook/rankorder/2003rank.txt 
Armed forces (active): 
International Institute for Strategic Studies (ed.), The Military Balance 2007, 
London 2007 
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OSCE Conferences, Meetings, and Events 2006/2007 
 
 
2006 
 

 

8-13 August OSCE Mission in Kosovo: Dokufest 2006: Documentary 
and short feature film festival  

14-24 August  OSCE Spillover Monitor Mission to Skopje: summer 
camp: “Let’s practise democracy and economy”  

26-26 August OSCE Spillover Monitor Mission to Skopje: round-table 
on education and decentralization  

14-15 September UNODC-OSCE joint workshop: Automated Donor 
Assistance Mechanism (ADAM) and Policing OnLine 
Information System (POLIS) 

18 September OSCE Chairmanship organizes a Caucasian concert, 
Vienna 

27 September  Conference on technology for democracy organized by 
the Belgian Chairmanship, Brussels 

2-13 October  Annual ODIHR Human Dimension Implementation 
Meeting, Warsaw 

2 October OSCE Representative on Freedom of the Media, side 
event at the 2006 Human Dimension Implementation 
Meeting: “Towards media self-regulation in the OSCE 
area”  

4-6 October  Joint ILO-OSCE workshop on security in ports, Antwerp 
17-18 October  Joint OSCE/UNECE/EurAsEC seminar on the 

Harmonization Convention of Frontier Controls of 
Goods, organized by the OSCE, the UNECE, EurAsEC 
and UNESCAP, Moscow 

19-20 October  The OSCE Representative on Freedom of the Media 
organizes a Central Asia media conference and training 
event, Bishkek 

23-25 October The HCNM visits Ukraine 
23-24 October 2nd OSCE Tolerance Implementation Meeting: Educa-

tion to promote mutual respect and understanding and to 
teach about the Holocaust, organized by OSCE Belgian 
Chairmanship, Ministry of Foreign Affairs of Croatia 

25 October 2006 Conference on energy security, organized by the Energy 
Charter Secretariat, the International Energy Agency, and 
the OSCE Brussels 

31 Oct. - 3 Nov.  The HCNM visits Georgia 
2-3 November  The OSCE Representative on Freedom of the Media or-

ganizes the “Third South Caucasus Media Conference 
and Training Event”, Tbilisi 
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2-3 November Third Supplementary Human Dimension Meeting of 
2006: “Democratization: Strengthening Democracy 
through Effective Representation”, Vienna 

6-7 November 2006 OSCE Mediterranean Seminar, Sharm El-Sheik 
8 November The OSCE Forum for Security Co-operation holds a 

workshop on the implementation of UN Security Council 
Resolution 1540, Vienna 

9-10 November ODIHR/OSCE Chairmanship organize Tolerance Imple-
mentation Meeting: “Addressing the Hate Crime Data 
Deficit”, Vienna 

13-15 November OSCE-UNODC second sub-regional expert workshop on 
“International Co-operation on Counter-Terrorism, 
Corruption and the Fight against Transnational Organized 
Crime”, Bucharest 

16-17 November First preparatory conference on land degradation and soil 
contamination for the 15th OSCE Economic and 
Environmental Forum, Bishkek 

16-17 November OSCE Special Representative on Combating Trafficking 
in Human Beings, Alliance against Trafficking in Per-
sons, 5th Alliance against Trafficking in Persons Confer-
ence on “Human Trafficking for Labour Exploitation/ 
Forced and Bonded Labour: Prosecution of Offenders, 
Justice for Victims”, Vienna 

24 November OSCE Strategic Police Matters Unit, Belgian Federal 
Police and the OSCE Chairmanship organize the first 
OSCE police chiefs meeting, Brussels  

24 November  Launch of the OSCE Policing OnLine Information 
System (POLIS), Brussels 

28 November  Conference “The Challenge of Educational Reform in 
Multi-Ethnic Central Asia” organized by the HCNM in 
collaboration with the Ministry of Public Education of 
the Republic of Uzbekistan, Tashkent 

4-5 December 14th OSCE Ministerial Council 2006, Brussels 
11-15 December Joint ILO-OSCE national tripartite workshop on port and 

supply chain security in Turkey, Istanbul 
 
 
2007 
 

 

1 January Spain takes over the OSCE Chairmanship from Belgium. 
Spanish Foreign Minister Miguel Ángel Moratinos 
becomes Chairman-in-Office 
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22-23 January 15th Economic and Environmental Forum – part one: 
“Key challenges to ensure environmental security and 
sustainable development in the OSCE area: Land degrad-
ation, soil contamination and water management”, 
Vienna 

22 January OSCE Ministerial Troika meeting, Vienna 
13-15 February Regional workshop for Central Asia and the Caucasus on 

“International Co-operation against Terrorism and 
Transnational Organized Crime” co-organized by the 
OSCE Action against Terrorism Unit (ATU) and the 
UNODC for experts from Central Asia and the Caucasus 
in charge of international co-operation in combating ter-
rorism, Antalya 

14 February 2007 annual high-level meeting between the Council of 
Europe, the OSCE, the United Nations, and partner organ-
izations in the “Tripartite-Plus” format on implementing 
the United Nations Global Counter-Terrorism Strategy, 
Vienna 

22-23 February OSCE Parliamentary Assembly Winter Meeting, Vienna 
12-13 March Second preparatory conference to the 15th OSCE 

Economic and Environmental Forum on “Key challenges 
to ensure environmental security and sustainable 
development in the OSCE area: Water Management”, 
Zaragoza 

16 March Civil society expert meeting on the design of the ODIHR 
Hate Crime Prevention and Response Resource Guide 
and Training, London 

21 March Special FSC meeting on combating the illicit trafficking 
of small arms and light weapons by air, organized by the 
Forum for Security Co-operation, Vienna 

22-23 March Third OSCE-wide workshop on legal co-operation in 
criminal matters to counter terrorism, organized by the 
OSCE Action against Terrorism Unit in partnership with 
the UNODC, Vienna 

27-28 March Annual gender focal points meeting, organized by the 
gender section of the OSCE Secretariat, Vienna 

29-30 March Supplementary Human Dimension Meeting: “Freedom of 
Assembly, Association and Expression”, Vienna 

19-20 April OSCE Strategic Police Matters Unit organizes meeting on 
lessons learned in the fight against organized crime, 
Vienna 

8-9 May OSCE Strategic Police Matters Unit holds police experts 
meeting on “Strengthening the role of the police and 
enhancing co-operation in combating terrorism”, Madrid 
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8-10 May HCNM visits former Yugoslav Republic of Macedonia 
14-15 May OSCE and Eurasia Foundation organize a meeting on 

“Promoting Good Governance in Customs: Lessons 
Learned from the Caucasus”, Tbilisi 

16-18 May ODIHR holds Human Dimension Seminar on “Effective 
Participation and Representation in Democratic Soci-
eties”, Warsaw 

20-22 May HCNM visits Russia 
21-23 May 15th Economic and Environmental Forum – part two on 

“Key challenges to ensure environmental security and 
sustainable development in the OSCE area: Land degrad-
ation, soil contamination and water management”, Prague

21 May Office of the Special Representative and Co-ordinator for 
Combating Trafficking in Human Beings organizes 
conference on “National Monitoring and Report 
Mechanisms to Address Trafficking in Human Beings: 
the Role of National Rapporteurs”, Vienna 

31 May-1 June OSCE Political Public-Private Partnership Conference: 
“Partnership of State Authorities, Civil Society and the 
Business Community in Combating Terrorism”, Vienna 

5-6 June OSCE Strategic Police Matters Unit holds meeting on 
gender balance in police management positions, Madrid 

7-8 Jun OSCE Chairmanship and the Ministry of Foreign Affairs 
of Romania organize high-level conference on “Combat-
ing Discrimination and Promoting Mutual Respect and 
Understanding”, Bucharest 

11-12 June OSCE Strategic Police Matters Unit arranges OSCE 
Western European regional police experts’ meeting on 
community policing, Vienna 

12-15 June Extraordinary Conference of the States Parties to the CFE 
Treaty, Vienna 

12-13 June 2007 OSCE-Mongolia conference on “Strengthening the 
Co-operative Security Between the OSCE and the Asian 
Partners for Co-operation”, Ulaanbaatar 

19-20 June 2007 Annual Security Review Conference, Vienna 
28-29 June OSCE Strategic Police Matters Unit organizes drugs 

experts conference, Vienna 
5-9 July 6th Annual Session of the OSCE Parliamentary 

Assembly, Kyiv 
12-13 July Second Supplementary Human Dimension Meeting in 

2007: “Promotion and Protection of Human Rights”, 
Vienna 

12 July Secretary General presents report on gender equality in 
the OSCE, Vienna 
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